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ITEMS OFFERED AT PUBLIC AUCTION

May 11, 2009

ltem No Parcel Number Minimum Bid | Purchase Amount
8 021-0201-016-0000 $34,900.00 NO BID
SB-1 022-0154-007-0000 $100.00 $100.00
SB-2 031-1390-022-0000 $100.00 NO BID
SB-4 052-0072-020-0000 $100.00 NO BID
SB-6 053-0104-033-0000 $100.00 NO BID
20 074-0143-050-0000 $1,700.00 $1,700.00
21 077-0064-009-0000 $18,800.00 $55,000.00
SB-19 237-0200-071-0000 $100.00 $100.00
48 252-0173-003-0000 $20,500.00 NO BID
49 252-0193-019-0000 $10,900.00 NO BID
51 262-0081-004-0000 $52,950.00 NO BID
52 263-0313-003-0000 $19,100.00 $19,100.00
53 265-0071-001-0000 $303,000.00 NO BID
55 265-0303-006-0000 $18,100.00 $19,500.00
61 275-0161-013-0000 $62,850.00 NO BID
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